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THERMOPAD. THERMO-ACTIVE CARPET CARE. 

UNIQUE. AND ONLY FROM COLUMBUS. 

Thermopad

Patented, economical damp clea-
ning system to leave carpeted 
floors in offices, businesses, hotel 
rooms and IT centres clean and 
immediately usable.

Impressive operating principle: the 
cleaning agent uses heat to quickly 
loosen even worn-in dirt, which is 
picked up fast and without residue  
by the Queen Bonnet Pad.

The system works equally effecti-
vely on all kinds of carpet and 
contributes to maintaining the 
quality of the flooring. 

Whisper quiet: the machine 
produces very little noise when in 
operation and can be used during 
working hours.

The heat supply can be altered by 
adjusting the thermostat, depen-
ding on the textile material.

Better for the environment: the 
moistened pad allows for the deep 
and thorough cleaning of carpets 
with minimal use of cleaning 
agents.

The special cleaner Maxil can be 
sprayed easily and evenly onto the 
floor with the pressure sprayer, and 
worn-in stains can be additionally 
targeted and treated.

Expanded spectrum of uses: the 
Thermopad is also suitable for 
oiling of parquet and wooden 
floors – with less oil, deeper penet-
ration and significantly shorter 
drying times compared to conven-
tional methods.

What’s more, by using the 
Thermopad, wax stains in churches  
or catering areas can be quickly 
loosened and removed without  
leaving residue.
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 Thermopad

L x W x H  450 x 565 x 1170 mm

Working width 430 mm

Ground clearance max. 135 mm

Working height max. 290 mm

Noise level 63 dB (A)

Weight 35 kg

ELECTRICAL DATA

Rated voltage 230 V / 50 Hz

Power total 3050 W

Power heater fan 2150 W

Driving motor 900 W

Mains cable 12 m

BRUSHES AND PAD HOLDERS

Speed 180 rpm
 


